
THE ARCTIC
THE SOLO CRUISE COMPANY

Arrive in Montreal, where we will be greeted by Silversea Cruises and
transported to our overnight accommodation.

Evening:
This evening, we will gather in the hotel bar for pre-dinner cocktails and
canapés, providing an opportunity to meet fellow travellers and your Solo
Cruise Company Concierge Host, who will be accompanying you
throughout your journey.

Considering the possibility of long travels to reach Montreal, the rest of your
evening is yours to enjoy at your leisure.

Meals:
Breakfast

Montreal, CanadaAug. 16th

Date
Aug. 16th - Sept. 8th, 2024 

Climate
Humid, -5 - 14°C

Ship
Silver Endeavour

Price
23 days 

from €27,286 



After breakfast today we will be transferred to the airport for our private
charter flight to the Iqaluit, the northernmost city in Canada.

Iqaluit is the capital city of the Canadian territory of Nunavut. It sits on vast
Baffin Island in Frobisher Bay. The island is known for its ice-capped
mountains and tundra valleys. Near the city, Sylvia Grinnell Territorial Park is
home to caribou and Arctic foxes. Qaummaarviit Territorial Park, on a tiny
island near the city, contains archaeological remains of the ancient Thule
people.

Formerly known as Frobisher Bay, the modern city of Iqaluit is rich with
traditional Inuit culture. It is the home of many Inuit artists, filmmakers and
musicians, plus there are arts and culture festivals staged in the spring and
summer that bring artists here from across the territory.

Afternoon:
In the afternoon, take a leisurely stroll around "the city" (more akin to a
large town) and explore the day-to-day life in this remote region of the far
North of Canada. Make sure to visit the Iqaluit Museum, boasting a
noteworthy collection of Inuit artefacts and an excellent array of Inuit art on
consignment—all crafted by local artists and available for purchase.

Evening:
Tonight, we will relish dinner at Silversea's pre-cruise hotel.

Meals: 
Breakfast & Dinner

Montreal – Iqaluit

After breakfast today, we will be transferred to the airport for our private
charter flight from Iqaluit to Pond Inlet, where we will embark on Silver
Endeavour.

Pond Inlet is a small, predominantly Inuit community of around 2,000
residents in the Qikiqtaaluk Region of Nunavut, Canada, located on northern
Baffin Island. To the Inuit the name of the place "is and always has been
Mittimatalik." 

Wildlife abounds in the Pond Inlet area. The region is home to caribou, polar
bears, Arctic foxes, ermines, lemmings, and Arctic hares. The coastal waters
have walrus, seals, beluga whales (white whale), and narwhals.

Meals: 
Breakfast & Dinner

Iqaluit, Canada – Pond Inlet, Canada

Aug. 17th

Aug. 18th



Today will be spent cruising the Cape Hay and Baylot Island environs.
Additionally, you will have the opportunity to enjoy Zodiac excursions in the
bay, offering a closer encounter with the local wildlife, guided by your
expedition team.

Cape Hay & Baylot Island, Canada

Buchan Gulf is a deep, elongated gash carved by glaciers during the last
Ice Age that cuts 22 miles into the eastern shores of Baffin Island. The most
striking feature in the Gulf ate impressive steep coastal cliffs and rock
pinnacles. The cliffs are comprised of hard Precambrian metamorphic rock
that rises as much as 2,000 feet from the sea. The conditions are perfect for
nesting Northern Fulmars, and in fact, this area is one of the most important
nesting sites for these birds in the world. European explorer William Baffin
first ventured here in the 15th century to search for the Northwest Passage

Throughout the day there will be expeditions activities with the Silversea
expedition team.

Buchan Guls, Canada

Aug. 19th

Aug. 20th

Days at sea are the perfect opportunity to relax, unwind and catch up with
what you’ve been meaning to do. So, whether that is going to the gym,
visiting the spa, whale watching, catching up on your reading or simply
spending the day watching the incredible scenery passing by, sea days are
the perfect balance to busy days filled with expeditions activities.

Day at SeaAug. 21st



Located at the heart of Nunavut, on Baffin Island’s Cumberland Peninsula,
Auyuittuq National Park offers you one of the most beautiful and striking
landscapes in Canada. Large valleys and steep-walled fjords surrounded
by a skyline of irregular peaks and massive glaciers, exactly how you would
picture the Arctic.

Auyuittuq homes little vegetation, however, you can however spot some
arctic wildlife species in these stunning and serene landscapes. Arctic foxes,
caribou, lemmings, snow geese, ermines, but also polar bears and many
bird species like peregrine falcons can be observed. Several cetacean’s
species frequent the surrounding waters of the island, narwhals, beluga
whales and orcas being the most likely to be seen. The coasts of the island
are a haven for many seabirds like the king eider or the little auk.

Established a national park in 1972, Auyuittuq holds an extremely important
place in Canada’s history due to its location. Many civilisations visited
Auyuittuq since the first people settled during the Stone Age, noting the
ideal conditions for whaling. Among them, Norse and English explorers but
also the Inuit, a people that left his mark on the island and all the Nunavut
region. Auyuittuq means “The Land That Never Melts” in Inuktitut, the national
park’s land being covered by the huge Penny Ice Glacier.

Auyuittuq National Park, Canada

Cape Dyer is a remote wilderness and lies at the southeast tip of Canada’s
vast Baffin Island. It is located north of the Arctic Circle in the Canadian
territory of Nunavut. Terraced cliffs rise up out of the icy sea as you sail close
to land and there is a smattering of the purest white snow-capped
mountains in the distance. 

Baffin Island is the largest island in Canada with a vast rugged landscape
which measures 507,451 square kilometres (195,928 square miles). It is the
fifth largest island in the world. If you're lucky you might just spot one of the
Polar bears which populate the island. Other animals which roam these
cold lands include Arctic foxes, Caribou and Arctic hares. Seals and
walruses can be seen hauled-out or close to shore in the water. 

Keep a look out for whales in the sea around Baffin Island, there are four
species for eagle eyed nature watchers to spot - Narwhals, Orca, Beluga
and Bowhead.

Cape Dyer (Nunavut), Canada

Aug. 22nd

Aug. 23rd



Morning:
Pangnirtung is an Inuit hamlet, in the Qikiqtaaluk Region of the Canadian
territory of Nunavut, located on Baffin Island. The community is located
about 45 km south of the Arctic Circle, and about 2,700 km from the North
Pole

This morning, we will undertake a Town walk as well as a visit to the local
Inuit Museum.

Afternoon:
The uninhabited Kekerten Island is to be found in the Cumberland Sound off
Baffin Island’s Cumberland Peninsula. It is in the Qikiqtaaluk Region of
Nunavut, Canada and part of the Canadian Arctic Archipelago. This is the
site of a former whaling station, which operating between 1840 and 1923
and is now a National Historic Site of Canada. 

The island is a fascinating open-air museum that still contains many
remains from the whaling era, such as large cast iron pots used to render
down the whale fat into oil, barrels to transport the oil, whalers burial
grounds, ship parts etc. When the bowhead whale stocks disappeared,
beluga whales and seals were harvested. 

The last years of existence saw the island used as a trading post before it
was abandoned in favour of the nearby community of Pangnirtung.

Pangnirtung & Kerkerten Island (Nunavut), CanadaAug. 24th



Morning:
Monumental Island is a splinter of ancient metamorphic rock, hunching in
the frigid waters of the Davis Strait, defying the ocean and ice around it.
Named to honour the legendary Polar Explorer Sir John Franklin, the island
displays everything Nunavut has to offer, in an ocean studded with vast
icebergs drifting across from Greenland. Monumental Island is a well-
known den site for polar bears, the icon of the Arctic; there is a good
chance to see mother bears with cubs on the island, as the bears become
trapped by the lack of summer ice, using the island as a base to hunt until
the ice returns in the Autumn. Seeing the white silhouette of a polar bear
against the ancient black rock and autumn tundra colours is an experience
that will remain long after returning on board. 

Groups of harp seals are a common sight in the waters around
Monumental Island, and can be very curious, often swimming very close to
investigate new objects such as boats. There are several sites on the island
also used as haul out sites for the charismatic Atlantic Walrus. These vast
animals are surprisingly gentle and skittish and can often be observed
caring for their calves on the rock bluffs while keeping a careful watch for
polar bears. 

Almost nowhere else in Nunavut can the charismatic wildlife of the Arctic
be observed in such a stunning setting.

Afternoon:
Named in honour of Sir John Franklin’s widow, the lonely and uninhabited
Lady Franklin Island lies off  Baffin Island’s Hall Peninsula, at the entrance to
Cumberland Sound. The island is named for the wife of Sir John Franklin, the
Arctic explorer who died trying to discover the Northwest Passage. 

The geology of the island is striking with vertical cliffs of Archean rocks,
likely to be some of the oldest stone in Canada. 

The waters around Lady Franklin Island offer an abundance seabirds,
ducks, seals, and walrus. With a bit of luck it is possible to see Atlantic
Puffins here and perhaps even a rare Sabine’s Gull.

Monumental & Lady Franklin Islands, CanadaAug. 25th



The Lower Savage Islands are a small group of islands off of the
southeastern tip of Baffin Island, and a common location for polar bears to
be found during the summer months. With plenty of land to roam while
giving each other a wide berth as well as opportunities to feed, it seems
that bears can be found here as the ice vanishes with the summer season’s
warming temperatures.

Lower Savage Islands, CanadaAug. 26th

Days at sea are the perfect opportunity to relax, unwind and catch up with
what you’ve been meaning to do. So, whether that is going to the gym,
visiting the spa, whale watching, catching up on your reading or simply
spending the day watching the incredible scenery passing by, sea days are
the perfect balance to busy days filled with expeditions activities.

Day at SeaAug. 27th

In the bustling capital city of Greenland, you could be forgiven for forgetting
you are in such a vast and isolated country. Nuuk is Greenland's economic
and social hub, home to more than a third of Greenland's population, and
although it feels like a world capital, scratch the surface and a uniquely
Greenlandic character can be found underneath. 

Nuuk Cathedral overlooks the gorgeous old Colonial Harbour district and
the Greenland National Museum, resting place of the legendary Qilakitsoq
mummies, the true highlight of the museum's archaeological collection. 

Above the Colonial Harbour sits downtown Nuuk, with lines of Scandi-style
apartments, a bustling shopping district, the Greenlandic Parliament, Nuuk
City Hall (which welcomes visitors to see its artwork) and even outdoor
cafes selling locally produced food and beer. These nods to modernity
compete for space with local artisan boutiques, the meat market selling the
catch from Nuuk's vast fjord-lands, and the stunning Katuaq Cultural Centre,
where blockbuster movies, as well as local and foreign performers entertain
the people of Nuuk. 

Although Nuuk has long been a melting pot of Danish and Greenlandic
ideas, this is a city where Greenland displays its sophistication, with the
Country's only traffic lights, roundabouts and University. Most of all, expect to
find a multitude of friendly people who are proud of who they are, and
equally proud of the city they call home.

Nuuk, GreenlandAug. 28th



18 kilometres northeast of Qaqortoq, Hvalsey is part of Qaqortukulooq, one
of the five sites of the UNESCO World Heritage Arctic farming complex
Kujataa. Between Eriksfjord to the north and Einarsfjord to the south, the
Hvalseyfjord branches off from Einarsfjord. 

Although Hvalsey is better known for the well-preserved ruins of one of the
sixteen churches in the Norse’s Eastern Settlement, the church was in a
farmstead known as Thjodhild’s Stead. This farmstead at the north-eastern
end of the fjord included a large building with living quarters, a hall and
livestock pens, as well as a storage building and a warehouse –the ruins of
which can still be seen. 

The Norse farming laid the foundation for the Inuit farming in later centuries,
leading to the UNESCO World Heritage status in 2017. In the 14th century
account “Descriptions of Greenland” the abundant fish, a reindeer farm on
Reindeer Island and Hvalsey’s name “Whale Island” clearly indicate that the
Norse had ample food sources at that time. The church was built in the
Anglo-Norwegian style of the 13th century but is known to have been built
over an older graveyard. The farmstead is mentioned in the Icelandic “Book
of Settlements” as property of the Kings of Norway, and the last
documented event of the Norse in Greenland is a wedding which took place
in the church in September 1408. 

After almost 600 years of abandonment, conservation work had to be done
to prevent the seaward wall from collapsing.

Hvalsey, GreenlandAug. 29th



Morning:
The largest town in southern Greenland, Qaqortoq has been inhabited since
prehistoric times. Upon arrival in this charming southern Greenland enclave,
it's easy to see why. Qaqortoq rises quite steeply over the fjord system
around the city, offering breath-taking panoramic vistas of the surrounding
mountains, deep, blue sea, Lake Tasersuag, icebergs in the bay, and
pastoral backcountry. 

Although the earliest signs of ancient civilisation in Qaqortoq date back
4,300 years, Qaqortoq is known to have been inhabited by Norse and Inuit
settlers in the 10th and 12th centuries. The present-day town was founded in
1774. 

In the years since, Qaqortoq has evolved into a seaport and trading hub for
fish and shrimp processing, tanning, fur production, and ship maintenance
and repair.

Afternoon:
In the local Kalaallisut language, Uunartoq means 'hot', and there is no
mystery why. Several warm springs exist in Greenland, but Uunartoq Island is
the only site where the waters form a pool warm enough to bathe in.
Although not as well-known as the famous springs of Iceland, nowhere can
challenge Uunartoq for scenery. 

The picturesque series of steaming pools are backed by some of the best
scenery Greenland has to offer. Icebergs larger than city blocks drift through
the labyrinth of fjords which make up Southern Greenland, passing as they
drift towards the ocean. Mountains pierce the clouds, and the tundra
blooms in the long summer days. And there is no better way to appreciate
the spectacular wilderness of South Greenland than from the perfectly
warmed natural comfort of the Uunartoq hot spring. 

The ancient crystalline rock of Southern Greenland is nearly two billion years
old. A fault in the rock allows water to sink down into the ground, where
Earth's internal heat warms it, causing it to rise again. Uunartoq Island is the
site where this water escapes, forming a sandy pool heated constantly from
below. 

Basic changing facilities and a grass walkway to the stone-lined pool allow
visitors comfort, while reconnecting with nature. It is believed that the Norse
settlers in Greenland knew of and made use of the pool, but the island has
never been inhabited, excluding a few summerhouses belonging to local
residents.

Qaqortog & Uunartog Island, GreenlandAug. 30th



Morning:
If you’re looking for remote and remarkable then look no further. Cruise
through Prince Christian Sound to the western end and you’ll find Aapilattoq,
a (very) small Greenlandic village of just 100 inhabitants. The name of the
village means “sea anemone” in the local Greenlandic language, and the
fact that the village has retained its Inuit name is a good indication of what
you can expect; traditional village life much as it has been for the past 100
years. 

Hunting and fishing are the main occupations here, and it is not unusual
when taking a stroll through Aappilattoq, past the small school (where 22
pupils from ages 3-16 are enrolled) and church, to come across a polar
bear skin drying in the wind behind a local dwelling. 

The village is hidden behind a prominent red rock and towering mountains,
which make the village virtually inaccessible by land. Naturally, the
Aapilattoq and its surrounding area are phenomenally rich in Arctic wildlife:
Arctic fox and Arctic hare live in the countryside around the village while
marine mammals include ringed seal, harbour seal, hooded seal, bearded
seal, harp seal, humpback whale (typically in summer), minke whale, fin
whale, narwhal, and beluga.

Afternoon:

The transit through the Sound is one of this voyage’s highlights. Connecting
the Labrador Sea with the Irminger Seat, Prince Christian Sound or “Prins
Christian Sund” in Danish is named after Prince (later King) Christian VII
(1749-1808). 100 km (60-miles), long and at times just 500 m (1500 ft) wide,
this majestic and spectacular fiord throws you back into a Viking era –
flanked by soaring snow-topped mountains, rock-strewn cliffs and rolling
hills, it is as if time has stood still and one easily forgets that this is the 21st
century. 

As you marvel at the sheer size of the mountains that surround you, with the
Arctic waters lapping deceptively at the hull, revel in the silence enveloping
you. Icebergs float serenely by, carrying with them the ages of time. Be sure
to wear warm clothing as this is one spectacle that you do not want to miss.

Aappilattog Island and Prince Christian Sound, GreenlandAug. 31st



Located on Greenland’s relatively rarely visited rugged east coast,
Skoldungen Fjord has enchanting scenery with towering mountains tipped
with snow, ice-scraped valley sides and sculptured icebergs in shades of
white and blue. At the top of the fjord one can easily see the retreating state
of the Thrym Glacier. 

The U-shaped fjord offers spectacular scenery and as an extra perk, it is not
uncommon to see whales in the fjord.

Skjoldungen, GreenlandSept. 1st

Days at sea are the perfect opportunity to relax, unwind and catch up with
what you’ve been meaning to do. So whether that is going to the gym,
visiting the spa, whale watching, catching up on your reading or simply
spending the day watching the incredible scenery passing by, sea days are
the perfect balance to busy days filled with expeditions activities.

Day at SeaSept. 2nd



Morning:
Upon disembarkation in Iceland, please collect your luggage, where you'll
be met by our private driver from Nordic Luxury in the arrival hall.
Subsequently, you will be transferred to the Iceland Parliament Hotel. Your
Concierge Host will be available to assist you at all times during your
arrival. Please ensure you keep your swimwear, sunglasses, etc., in a
separate small bag, as we have a surprise for you!

Unwind in a steamy oasis just minutes outside of downtown Reykjavik that
will transport you between the expansive North Atlantic Ocean and the
nurturing waters of a geothermal lagoon. Sky Lagoon’s magnificent infinity-
style pool allows you to feel immersed in the sea with its impressive illusion,
wrapping you in a mist of comforting steam while the glazed surface of the
Atlantic extends out in front of you.

The lagoon also takes inspiration from elements of Viking architecture,
such as the rugged lava rock interior that mimics the Icelandic landscape,
the authentic turf wall on the exterior of the building, and the turf shelter
encompassing the spa. The spa offers you the opportunity to indulge in the
seven-step ritual, featuring a wet sauna, cold fog mist, and body scrub,
among other rejuvenating features, as well as a spacious dry sauna with a
floor-to-ceiling window view of the ocean scenery. If you really want to
invigorate your senses, take a dip in the adjacent cold plunge pool – a
centuries-old Icelandic tradition to finish off the experience.

Afternoon:
This afternoon, we’ll be joined by a Reykjavik food guide who will introduce
us to Icelandic cuisine. Icelandic food has developed from simple
beginnings to modern ingenuity, still infusing many of the same ingredients
while creating new and enticing flavour profiles. Traditional cuisine has
always involved a diet of meat and fish, but while the people's palates have
transformed, so have many dishes. Not only can you find meat-centred
meals at local restaurants, but a range of vegan/vegetarian options, too!

On our food walk around Reykjavik, you'll discover Icelandic cuisine at its
very best as you taste elements of history and future in an exciting
selection of bites! You'll be sampling so many exquisite dishes; it'll be more
than enough to leave you satisfied once your food adventure concludes.
Savor some of the freshest recipes you can find in the capital and learn
how Icelanders have made their food the finest of the Nordic countries.

Evening:
This evening is at leisure for you to relax and dine at the hotel.

Meals: 
Breakfast & Snacks

Skjoldungen, GreenlandSept. 3rd

https://www.hilton.com/en/hotels/rekpsqq-iceland-parliament-hotel/


After breakfast and checking out of the hotel, we embark on Iceland’s
famed Golden Circle tour.

The Golden Circle is a premier sightseeing adventure in Iceland,
showcasing three iconic landmarks that epitomise the country's natural
beauty. Thingvellir National Park, Gullfoss Waterfall, and the mighty Geysir
combine to offer an unforgettable journey through Iceland's breathtaking
landscapes.

Our first stop is Thingvellir National Park, the only national park in Iceland to
hold UNESCO World Heritage Status. Situated between the North American
and Eurasian tectonic plates, this park features remarkable geological
formations, including lava rocks, volcanoes, and the country's largest lake,
Thingvallavatn. Notably, it also holds historical significance as the site of
Iceland's first parliament, established in 930 A.D.

Next, we visit Geysir, a renowned geothermal area famous for its impressive
hot springs. While the Great Geysir itself has been dormant for nearly a
century, its neighbour, Strokkur, erupts approximately every ten minutes,
shooting water up to 20-40 meters into the air.

We then experience Iceland's unique geothermal baking tradition at a local
bakery. Witness how traditional Icelandic rye bread is made using natural
geothermal heat, resulting in a warm and fluffy delicacy served with
authentic Icelandic accompaniments.

Our final stop on the Golden Circle is Gullfoss Waterfall, a majestic cascade
plunging into an ancient valley. Fed by the Hvíta River, originating from the
Langjökull glacier, this powerful waterfall showcases nature's grandeur,
particularly during the summer months when its flow is most intense.
Admire the breathtaking scenery, often enhanced by the appearance of
rainbows shimmering in the mist.

Afterward, we visit Friðheimar farm, renowned for its sustainable organic
produce, particularly juicy tomatoes grown year-round in their
greenhouses. Founded by spouses Knútur Rafn Ármann and Helena
Hermundardóttir, this family-run restaurant utilises Iceland's geothermal
energy to cultivate fresh produce despite the country's challenging climate.
Dine inside the greenhouse amidst thriving plants, enjoying an unparalleled
culinary experience with exceptionally fresh and flavourful dishes.

Evening:
Dinner at the hotel (payable locally) & overnight at Hotel Geysir or similar.

Meals: 
Breakfast & Lunch

Golden Circle, Geothermal Bakery & Frioheimar, IcelandSept. 4th



After breakfast we’ll check out of the hotel and head off for a day of
spectacular Icelandic sightseeing.

Thorsmork is home to some of the most diverse and versatile trails in
Iceland, allowing you to explore short and scenic paths, as well as more
challenging and detailed ones. Here, all the most breathtaking natural
wonders come together to form unrivalled views of the landscape.
Mountains, volcanoes, glaciers, and sweeping valleys make up just some of
the amazing features found in this area.

Evening:
Dinner tonight at the hotel (payable locally) & overnight at the Hotel Ranga  
or similar.

Meals: 
Breakfast & Lunch

Thorsmork Super Jeep Adventure, IcelandSept. 5th

Today, you'll explore Iceland's most scenic region: the south coast. This
breathtaking stretch of land showcases some of the country's youngest
geological formations, many of which emerged during the last Ice Age. A
full-day excursion awaits, offering a glimpse into the wonders of Icelandic
nature. Along the journey, you'll visit the renowned Seljalandsfoss and
Skógafoss waterfalls, each with its own mesmerising charm. Immerse
yourself in the enchanting landscapes of volcanoes, glaciers, and
mountains, transporting you to a world straight out of a fairy tale.

Venture into the otherworldly realm near the base of the Katla volcano,
where a landscape of volcanic sand and remarkable natural wonders
awaits. Amidst this surreal backdrop of volcanic debris and moss-covered
mountainsides lie extraordinary ice caves, nestled atop a vast glacier
amidst the rugged terrain. These two elements of nature coexist in striking
contrast to one another.

The ice caves offer a magical glimpse into the intricate beauty of glacial
movements, forming captivating caverns of transparent ice adorned with
vibrant blues and streaks of black ash. Crystal-like formations adorn every
surface, frozen in an array of shapes and patterns, creating a pristine
universe amidst the rugged volcanic landscape. With new caves forming
each year, the possibilities of what you'll encounter inside are endless.

Tonight, dinner (payable locally) will be served at the Hotel Ranga.

Meals: 
Breakfast & Lunch

South Coast & Katla Ice CaveSept. 6th

https://hotelranga.is/


After breakfast we’ll check out of the hotel and head off for a once in a
lifetime opportunity- we’ll be descending into a dormant volcano!

Iceland is one of the most volcanically active destinations in the world,
mostly due to its location on the Mid-Atlantic Ridge. In the centre of the
ridge stands this immovable volcano known as Thríhnúkagígur, roughly
translating to Three Peaks Crater, and its presence here brings travellers to
Iceland a once-in-a-lifetime opportunity. 

Here, you'll descend into a vast and vibrant magma chamber of an
Icelandic volcano that has remained inactive for over 4,000 years.

This journey will see you lowered into the opening with a specially designed
and secure lift. As your descent begins, the magma chamber and its
beauty become instantly apparent, displaying a range of colorations and
bizarre textures. 

Expect to see rough walls and intricate formations splattered in yellows,
blues, violets, and oranges; so vibrant, that their hue creates a different
universe entirely. Once you reach the bottom, the sheer power of this titanic
natural force becomes overwhelming, and suddenly its vastness swallows
you in wonderment.

Afternoon:
We’ll travel back to Reykjavik and arrive early afternoon where we will return
to the Iceland Parliament Hotel. The remainder of your day is it leisure for
you to return to the town centre for some of excellent shopping or perhaps
a coffee at the famous Mokka Kaffi café, made famous by the American
singer & songwriter (and Icelandic citizen), John Grant. 

Evening:
Having spent the most amazing 21-days together, we can’t let you leave
without celebrating our incredible travels through the Canadian Arctic,
Greenland and Iceland. So, we have a very beautiful “farewell dinner”
planned for you this evening which is a celebration of the very best cuisine
and culinary talent in Iceland.

Meals: 
Breakfast/Lunch/Dinner

South Coast & Katla Ice CaveSept. 7th



After breakfast this morning we will begin our transfers by private car or
van to the airport to coincide with your departure flights throughout the
day. 

We strongly believe that you should be comfortable right until your
departure for the airport and therefore should you have an afternoon or
evening flight departure, your hotel room will be available to you right up
until 6.00pm in the evening.

Your Concierge Host (along with our local airport hosts) will be available to
assist you at all times prior to departure and with your check-in at the
airport.

It’s always sad to say goodbye but we would just like to say that all of us at
The Solo Cruise Company are so very grateful to you for choosing to travel
with us and for becoming a part of our wonderfully unique family of
travellers. We sincerely hope your travels were not only enjoyable and
enlightening, but that you have come away having made some very
special and wonderful new friends. 

We can’t wait to welcome you back on your next voyage of discovery.

Meals: 
Breakfast

Departure flights to your home citySept. 8th



Included

Excluded

Services of our Concierge Host throughout your entire journey
16-day Canadian Arctic & Greenland expeditions cruise onboard Silversea Silver
Endeavour
1-night pre cruise hotel accommodation in Montreal
Private car transfer airport to hotel on arrival
Group transfer hotel/ airport
Private charter flights Montreal to Iqaluit and Iqaluit to Pond Inlet
1-night pre cruise accommodation in Iqaluit
Group transfer airport/hotel in Iqaluit and Pond Inlet airport/ship
5-nights luxury touring in Iceland inclusive of accommodation, transport, meals 
 and sightseeing excursions and experiences as outlined in the itinerary
Multiple experiences and excursions as noted in the itinerary
Late check out (up to 6.00pm, subject to flight departure time) on departure 
from Iceland
Private car & group transfers as noted in the itinerary

Long-haul intercontinental flights to Montreal and from Reykjavik
Airline luggage charges in excess of one 23kg checked bag
 (Expedition private charter flights are restricted to 1 x 23kg checked luggage per
guest)
Visa fees
Comprehensive travel insurance
Meals & beverages not mentioned in the itinerary
Laundry & dry-cleaning services
Items of a personal nature
Credit card fees if paying by Visa, Mastercard or American Express



Further Details

Minimum age is 55 years.
This journey contains some active elements, including walks over uneven terrain
and labour-intensive activities.
Specific regarding booking and terms can be found in the Terms & Conditions.
the Privacy Policy, or by contacting support@solocruisecompany.com.

Silver Endeavour

https://solocruisecompany.com/terms-and-conditions
https://solocruisecompany.com/privacy-policy

